NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON SCOREBOARD REPLACEMENT AND REPAIRS, MCSD No. 15-0050-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: JANUARY 14, 2015 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2016

BOARD APPROVED ON JANUARY 13, 2015

Posted Thursday, December 11, 2014 2:15 pm Posted Wednesday, January 14, 2015 10:55 am Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., Thursday, December 4, 2014

					5.	Lathem		
State	County	ounty Bidder's Name	Single Fixed Percentage Discount Offer (Equipment Delivered and Installed)		Discount for Parts and Accessories		Labor Rate for Se	
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	Bid Price	Note
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		0%		\$73.50	
L	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	<u>1</u>
					5.	Lathem		
State	County	Bidder's Name	Warranty Labor			ty Parts and	Website for	
Desce	Councy		% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	11000	108 101
	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		No Bid			
FL			N		No Bid			
	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid					
FL IL FL		Nevco, Inc. Team C Sports	No Bid		No Bid			
IL	Bond		No Bid		No Bid			
IL	Bond		No Bid Single Fixed Offer (Equip		No Bid 6. Discount		Labor Rate	for Se
FL	Bond Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and	No Bid 6. Discount	Nevco for Parts and	Labor Rate	for Se
FL State	Bond Charlotte County	Team C Sports Bidder's Name	No Bid Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and nstalled)	No Bid 6. Discount	Nevco for Parts and essories	Bid Price	Note
IL FL State	Bond Charlotte	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and installed) Notes	No Bid 6. Discount Acc	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.50 No Bid	Note
State FL	Bond Charlotte County Seminole	Team C Sports Bidder's Name	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and nstalled) Notes (2) (3)	No Bid 6. Discount Acc % Discount	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes	Bid Price	Note
FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and nstalled) Notes (2) (3)	No Bid 6. Discount Acc % Discount 12% 12%	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.50 No Bid	Note
State FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and nstalled) Notes (2) (3)	No Bid 6. Discount Acc % Discount 12% 12% No Bid	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.50 No Bid	Note
State FL	County Seminole Bond Charlotte	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip % Discount 12% No Bid	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and nstalled) Notes (2) (3)	No Bid 6. Discount Acc % Discount 12% 12% No Bid 6. Warrant	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.50 No Bid No Bid	Note
State FL IL FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc. Team C Sports	Single Fixed Offer (Equip % Discount 12% No Bid	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and installed) Notes (2) (3)	No Bid 6. Discount Acc % Discount 12% 12% No Bid 6. Warrant	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes Nevco ty Parts and essories	Bld Price \$73.50 No Bid No Bid	Note
State FL IL FL	County Seminole Bond Charlotte	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc. Team C Sports	Single Fixed Offer (Equip % Discount 12% No Bid	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and installed) Notes (2) (3) ranty Labor	No Bid 6. Discount Acc % Discount 12% 12% No Bid 6. Warrant Acc	Nevco for Parts and essories Notes Nevco ty Parts and essories	Bld Price \$73.50 No Bid No Bid	Note

					7. M	ac Gregor			
State County		ounty Bidder's Name	Offer (Equip	Single Fixed Percentage Discount Offer (Equipment Delivered and Installed)				Labor Rate for Se	
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	Bld Price	Note	
FL .	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		0%		\$73.50	0	
L	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bio		
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid	ì	No Bid		No Bio		
						ac Gregor			
State	County	Bidder's Name	War	ranty Labor		ty Parts and essories	Website for		
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	Webs	BILLE IO	
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		No Bid				
IL	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid				
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid		No Bid				
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid	Percentage Discount	No Bid		I shor Peta	for Se	
			No Bid Single Fixed Offer (Equip		No Bid 8. Rat Discount	uland Borg	Labor Rate	for Se	
State	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled)	No Bid 8. Rat Discount	uland Borg for Parts and essories	Labor Rate Bld Price	_	
State FL	County	Team C Sports	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes	8. Rati	uland Borg for Parts and essories		Note	
State FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and nstalled) Notes	8. Rat Discount Acce	uland Borg for Parts and essories	Bld Price	Note	
FL State	County	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes	8. Rate Discount Acce % Discount	uland Borg for Parts and essories	Bid Price	Note	
State FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes	8. Rate Discount Acce % Discount O% No Bid No Bid	uland Borg for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.60 No Bid	Note	
State FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes	8. Rate Discount Acce % Discount No Bid No Bid 8. Rate	uland Borg for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.60 No Bid	Note	
State FL	County Seminole Bond	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc.	Single Fixed Offer (Equip II % Discount No Bid No Bid	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes	8. Rat Discount Acce % Discount No Bid No Bid 8. Rat Warrant	uland Borg for Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.00 No Bid	Note	
State FL L FL State	County Seminole Bond Charlotte County	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc. Team C Sports Bidder's Name	Single Fixed Offer (Equip II % Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid Warn % Discount	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes ranty Labor Notes	8. Rat Discount Acce % Discount No Bid No Bid 8. Rat Warrant	land Borg for Parts and essories Notes land Borg y Parts and essories	Bld Price \$73.00 No Bid	Note	
State FL State	County Seminole Bond Charlotte County Seminole	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc. Team C Sports Bidder's Name	Single Fixed Offer (Equip II % Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid Wart % Discount	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes ranty Labor Notes	8. Rate Discount Account No Bid	land Borg for Parts and essories Notes land Borg y Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.00 No Bid	Note	
State FL IL FL State	County Seminole Bond Charlotte County	Bidder's Name Hufcor Florida Group Nevco, Inc. Team C Sports Bidder's Name	Single Fixed Offer (Equip II % Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid Warn % Discount	Percentage Discount ment Delivered and natalled) Notes ranty Labor	8. Rate Discount Accomplete No Bid No Bid 8. Rate Warrant Accomplete No Discount	aland Borg for Parts and essories Notes Iland Borg y Parts and essories Notes	Bld Price \$73.00 No Bid	Note	

					9.	Varsity			
State County		County Bidder's Name	Offer (Equip	Single Fixed Percentage Discount Offer (Equipment Delivered and installed)				Labor Rate for Se	
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	Bid Price	Note	
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		0%		\$73.50		
IL	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	-	
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid	No Bid No Bid			No Bid		
					9.	Varsity			
State	County	Bidder's Name	War	ranty Labor		ty Parts and	Wohe	site fo	
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	Webs	ille 10	
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		No Bid				
IL	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid				
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	No Bid		No Bid				
				Percentage Discount			Labor Rate	for Sc	
State	County	Bidder's Name		Installed)		Accessories		Labor Nate for Se	
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes	Bid Price	Note	
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		0%		\$73.50		
IL	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		
FL .	Charlotte	Team C Sports	16%	(6)	16%	(6)	\$75.00		
					10. Other	Manufactures			
		ounty Bidder's Name	Wari	Warranty Labor		Warranty Parts and			
State	County					Accessories		ite for	
			% Discount	Notes	% Discount	Notes			
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No Bid		No Bid				
	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid				
IL FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	5 Years						

State	County	Bidder's Name	
State	County	Didder 5 Name	Name
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	No
IL	Bond	Nevco, Inc.	Hufcor Florida Group
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	Sign Tech

			Charges for Repair on Existing Equipment					
State	County	Bidder's Name	1. Hourly Rate, Standard Working Hours (Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm)		2. Hourly Rate, Non-Standard Working Hours (Monday - Friday prior to 8:00am and after 5:00pm, Saturday and		3. Hourly Rat	
			Bid Price Notes		Bld Price	Notes	Bid Price	Note
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	\$73.50		\$73.50		\$73.50	
ĬĹ	Bond	Nevco, Inc.		(5)		(5)		
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	\$75.00	-	\$125.00		\$200.00	

State	County	Bidder's Name	Charges for Repair on Existing Equipment 4. Material for Repairs Percentage Markup		
			Bid Price	Notes	
FL	Seminole	Hufcor Florida Group	10%		
IL	Bond	Nevco, Inc.		(5)	
FL	Charlotte	Team C Sports	20%		

NOTES:

- (1) 1 year limited Parts and Accessories and 5 years limited Scoreboards
- (2) Free shipping
- (3) List catalog price includes free delivery
- (4) As per Hufcor
- (5) Provided by Hufcor Group
- (6) OES Scoreboards

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes."

Hufcor Florida Group Brian Hartman, Sales Manager 407-302-2286 sales@hufcorfl.com

Nevco, Inc. Gregory Premer 618-664-0398 gpremer@nevco.com

Team C Sports Mark Cyganiak 239-410-4062